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Bibliogov, United States, 2013. Paperback. Book Condition:
New. 246 x 189 mm. Language: English . Brand New Book *****
Print on Demand *****.The U.S. Geological Survey (USGS) is
initiating a new project designed to improve resiliency to
natural hazards in southern California through the application
of science to community decision making and emergency
response. The Multi-Hazards Demonstration Project will assist
the region s communities to reduce their risk from natural
hazards by directing new and existing research towards the
community s needs, improving monitoring technology,
producing innovative products, and improving dissemination
of the results. The natural hazards to be investigated in this
project include coastal erosion, earthquakes, floods, landslides,
tsunamis, and wildfires. Americans are more at risk from
natural hazards now than at any other time in our Nation s
history. Southern California, in particular, has one of the
Nation s highest potentials for extreme catastrophic losses due
to natural hazards, with estimates of expected losses exceeding
$3 billion per year. These losses can only be reduced through
the decisions of the southern California community itself. To be
effective, these decisions must be guided by the best
information about hazards, risk, and the cost-effectiveness of
mitigation technologies. The USGS will...
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